
HUNTINGDONSHIRE DISTRICT COUNCIL 
 
 

CABINET 

 

 
THURSDAY, 22 APRIL 2010 

 
 

DECISION SHEET 
 
PRESENT: 
 

I C Bates, K J Churchill, D B Dew, J A Gray, Mrs D C Reynolds, T V Rogers and 
L M Simpson 

APOLOGIES: 
 

A Hansard and C R Hyams 

 

ITEM NO. SUBJECT CONTACT OFFICER 

1  Provision Of Play Facilities In Huntingdonshire    

   

 Agreed to investigate the co-ordination of insurance for 
Parishes wishing to insure their facilities under a group 
scheme and the feasibility and cost of providing ROSPA 
inspections for all outdoor facilities in Town and Parish 
Councils. 

Miss H Ali 
388006 

   

2  Housing and Council Tax Benefits Anti-Fraud Strategy 
and Prosecution Policy   

 

   

 Noted the contents of the report and approved the content 
of a revised and enhanced Benefit Fraud Strategy and 
Policy for the prosecution and sanction of those persons 
found to have been committing benefit fraud. Authorised 
staff within the Fraud Team to undertake investigations in 
fraud affecting Local Taxation and Housing Services and 
other services and to report to the relevant Head of Service 
on the outcomes, findings and recommendations arising 
from these investigations. 

Mrs J Barber 
388105 

   

3  Chequers Court Planning Brief Supplementary 
Planning Document   

 

   

 Agreed to adopt the contents of the planning brief for 
Chequers Court, Huntingdon as a Supplementary Planning 
Document and authorised  the Head of Planning Services 
to make any minor consequential amendments to the text 
and illustrations, after consultation with the Executive 
Councillor for Planning Strategy and Transport. 

M Huntington 
388404 

   

4  Performance Management    

   

 noted the Council's performance against targets within the 
Corporate Plan - "Growing Success" 

H Thackray 
388035 



ITEM NO. SUBJECT CONTACT OFFICER 
 

   

5  Review Of Targets In Growing Success    

   

 Approved the revised 2010/2011 targets for the objectives 
in “Growing Success” – the Council’s Corporate Plan. 

Ms C Garbett 
388459 

   

6  Private Sector Housing Enforcement, The Criminal Law 
Act 1977 & The Protection From Harassment Act 1997   

 

   

 delegated authority to the Director of Environmental and 
Community Services to appoint Environmental Health 
Officers and Environmental Health Protection Officers to 
enforce the relevant provisions of the Criminal Law Act 
1977 and Protection from Harassment Act 1977 and to 
instigate the necessary legal proceedings. 

J Allan 
388281 

   

7  Great Fen Masterplan    

   

 Noted the approval of the Great Fen Masterplan by the 
Project Steering Committee. 

M Sharp 
388300 

   

8  St Neots Eastern Expansion Members Steering Group    

   

 Agreed to increase the District Council’s membership on 
the St Neots Eastern Expansion Steering Group to 6 
members and delegated their appointment to the Chief 
Executive, after consultation with the Deputy Leader of the 
Council. 

S Ingram 
388400 

   

9  Financial Monitoring - Revenue Budget    

   

 noted the projected budget outturn for 2009/2010 together 
with details of variations from the previous forecast and 
agreed to transfer the actual underspend to the special 
reserve account. 

S Couper 
388103 

   

10  Capital Programme Monitoring 2009/10 Budget    

   

 Noted the anticipated variations in the Capital Programme 
in the current year. 

S Couper 
388103 

   

11  Partnership Agreement For ICT Development Within 
Cambridgeshire   

 

   

 Approved the principle of entering into the Information 
Management and Technology Partnership and authorised 
the Director of Commerce and Technology, after 

T Parker 
388100 



ITEM NO. SUBJECT CONTACT OFFICER 
 

consultation with the Executive Councillor for Environment 
and Information Technology, to enter the resulting 
partnership agreement. 

   

12  Land At Cemetery Road, St Neots    

   

 Agreed to the formal transfer of land at Cemetery Road, St. 
Neots to St. Neots Town Council for the purpose of a burial 
ground. 

K Phillips 
388260 

   

13  Western Link Road, Huntingdon    

   

 Authorised the Director of Central Services, after 
consultation with the Executive Councillors for Finance and 
for Resources and Policy to approve the proposed terms for 
the acquisition of properties required for the implementation 
of the western link road, subject to a risk assessment that 
demonstrates there is unlikely to be a net cost to the 
Council. 

K Phillips 
388260 

   

 


